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Alanoud F. Alqahtani

From: Mohammad Y. Alshaikh
Sent: Sunday, September 15, 2024 3:28 PM
To: Alanoud F. Alqahtani
Cc: Abdulrahman Y. Alshaikh; Syed Abdulaleem; Ahmed M. Ewis
Subject: RE:  ك مياةཥྍويلفير 3الوحدة  -زيادة استه

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

 يعتمد 
 

Thanks & Best Regards, 

 

 

 

Mohammad Y. Alshaikh 
Director of Finance and Operations 
Awtad Company 

7295 (Majdoul Tower) 
Floor no. 38 
Riyadh 12262-3254 
Kingdom of Saudi Arabia 

 T : +966 114222090   
M :+966 580703078 
E :  Malshaikh@awtad.sa 
W: www.awtad.sa 
 

 
 

From: Alanoud F. Alqahtani <113@awtad.sa>  
Sent: Sunday, September 15, 2024 1:17 PM 
To: Mohammad Y. Alshaikh <malshaikh@awtad.sa> 
Cc: Abdulrahman Y. Alshaikh <aalshaikh@awtad.sa>; Syed Abdulaleem <411@awtad.sa>; Ahmed M. Ewis 
<218@awtad.sa> 
Subject: RE:  اةᘭادة استهلاك مᗫ3الوحدة   -ز  ᢕᣂلفᗫو   

 
  المحترم،                   المدير المالي والتشغيلي / محمد بن يحيى

  
  نطلب اعتمادكم فيما يخص الايميل أدناه لتحميل الموظفين مبلغ استهلاك الماء. ليتم خصمها من راتب الشهر الحالي 

  ر.س  660.84مبلغ وقدره :  2728 –ياسين خان 
 ر.س   660.84مبلغ وقدره :  2726 –الامين 

 

Best Regards, 

 

  
  
  
  
  

Alanoud F. Alqahtani 
AdministraƟve Accountant 
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Awtad Company 
   

 
 

From: Abdulhafeez Z. Mukadam <244@awtad.sa>  
Sent: Wednesday, September 11, 2024 5:20 PM 
To: Ahmed M. Ewis <218@awtad.sa>; Mujahe R. Rana <253@awtad.sa> 
Cc: Mohammad Y. Alshaikh <malshaikh@awtad.sa>; Mohamed H. Hashem <211@awtad.sa>; Syed Abdulaleem 
<411@awtad.sa>; Alanoud F. Alqahtani <113@awtad.sa> 
Subject: Re:  اةᘭادة استهلاك مᗫ3الوحدة   -ز   ᢕᣂلفᗫو  
 
Yasin khan - 2728 
Al amin - 2726 
 

    Thanks & Best Regards.  

  
  

Eng. Abdul Hafiz  

Maintenance Engineer. 

Awtad Al Akaria 

2702 Dirah, Maegliah Center  

Tower 3, 4th Floor, Office 406  

Riyadh 12633-7437  

Saudi Arabia  
  Phone +966 11 411 5500  

Mobile +966 50 475 2879  

Email 244@awtad.sa  

www.awtad.sa  

  

  

  

 

From: Ahmed M. Ewis <218@awtad.sa> 
Sent: Wednesday, September 11, 2024 4:53 PM 
To: Abdulhafeez Z. Mukadam <244@awtad.sa>; Mujahe R. Rana <253@awtad.sa> 
Cc: Mohammad Y. Alshaikh <malshaikh@awtad.sa>; Mohamed H. Hashem <211@awtad.sa>; Syed Abdulaleem 
<411@awtad.sa>; Alanoud F. Alqahtani <113@awtad.sa> 
Subject: RE:  اةᘭادة استهلاك مᗫ3الوحدة   -ز   ᢕᣂلفᗫو  
  

السادة / قسم الصيانة  
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بعد التحية ،،،،، 
 

طبقا لتوجية المدير المالى والتشغيلى يتم تحميل مبلغ استهلاك المياة بمعرض ويلفير  
ریال 1321.67المبلغ وقدرة   الشاغر على العمال الذين استخدموا المياة وقدرها 3رقم 

وعلية برجاء الافادة باسماء العمال لتحمل هذا المبلغ من جانب الشئون الادارية بالشركة.
 

    ولسيادتكم جزيل الشكر
 

  

 

  

Ahmed M Ewis 
Accountant 
Awtad 

2702 Dirah, Maegliah Center 
Tower 3, 4th Floor, Office 406 
Riyadh 12633-7437 
Saudi Arabia 

  Phone +966 11 411 5500 
Mobile +966 55 218 3099 
Email 218@awtad.sa 
www.awtad.sa 
  

  
  
  
From: Abdulhafeez Z. Mukadam <244@awtad.sa>  
Sent: Wednesday, September 11, 2024 4:20 PM 
To: Ahmed M. Ewis <218@awtad.sa>; Mujahe R. Rana <253@awtad.sa> 
Cc: Mohammad Y. Alshaikh <malshaikh@awtad.sa>; Mohamed H. Hashem <211@awtad.sa>; Syed Abdulaleem 
<411@awtad.sa> 
Subject: Re:  اةᘭادة استهلاك مᗫزM-  3الوحدة    ᢕᣂلفᗫو  
  
Dear Ahmed, 
  
Due to not available accommodation of cleaners they temporary using the water for shower and toilet 
use and in welfare don't have any service toilet for our workers ,  
  
so during maintenance work timing they are use this toilet. 
  
This is the reason the amount of water is high. but from this month we close the all water supply from 
show room 03.and also close the entrance. 
  

    Thanks & Best Regards.  

  
  

Eng. Abdul Hafiz  

Maintenance Engineer. 

2702 Dirah, Maegliah Center  

Tower 3, 4th Floor, Office 406  
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Awtad Al Akaria Riyadh 12633-7437  

Saudi Arabia  

  Phone +966 11 411 5500  

Mobile +966 50 475 2879  

Email 244@awtad.sa  

www.awtad.sa  

  

  

  

  

From: Ahmed M. Ewis <218@awtad.sa> 
Sent: Wednesday, September 11, 2024 10:43 AM 
To: Abdulhafeez Z. Mukadam <244@awtad.sa>; Mujahe R. Rana <253@awtad.sa> 
Cc: Mohammad Y. Alshaikh <malshaikh@awtad.sa>; Mohamed H. Hashem <211@awtad.sa>; Syed Abdulaleem 
<411@awtad.sa> 
Subject: RE:  اةᘭادة استهلاك مᗫزM-  3الوحدة    ᢕᣂلفᗫو  
  
 ــ                                                                                                                                                                                                                تـــــــــ
 ــذكير  

 
السادة / قسم الصيانة  

تحية طيبة وبعد ،،،،،                                     
  

موقع ويلفير سنتر   3برجاء التكرم بالافادة عن الاستهلاك الغير طبيعى للمياة بالوحدة 
ك .م مع العلم أن الوحدة شاغرة .  120حيث انة يوجد استهلاك شهرى      98100535رقم العداد

  
مرفق : صورة للعداد  

   وتفضلوا بقبول وافر التحية والاحترام                                  

 

  

  
  

 

  

Ahmed M Ewis 
Accountant 
Awtad 

2702 Dirah, Maegliah Center 
Tower 3, 4th Floor, Office 406 
Riyadh 12633-7437 
Saudi Arabia 
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  Phone +966 11 411 5500 
Mobile +966 55 218 3099 
Email 218@awtad.sa 
www.awtad.sa 
  

  
  
  
From: Ahmed M. Ewis  
Sent: Monday, September 9, 2024 2:40 PM 
To: Abdulhafeez Z. Mukadam <244@awtad.sa>; Mujahe R. Rana <253@awtad.sa> 
Cc: Mohammad Y. Alshaikh <malshaikh@awtad.sa>; Mohamed H. Hashem <211@awtad.sa>; Syed Abdulaleem 
<411@awtad.sa> 
Subject:   اةᘭادة استهلاك مᗫزM-  3الوحدة   ᢕᣂلفᗫو  
  
  

 
السادة / قسم الصيانة  

تحية طيبة وبعد ،،،،،                                     
  

موقع ويلفير سنتر   3برجاء التكرم بالافادة عن الاستهلاك الغير طبيعى للمياة بالوحدة 
ك .م مع العلم أن الوحدة شاغرة .  120حيث انة يوجد استهلاك شهرى      98100535رقم العداد

  
مرفق : صورة للعداد  

   وتفضلوا بقبول وافر التحية والاحترام                                  

 

  

Ahmed M Ewis 
Accountant 
Awtad 

2702 Dirah, Maegliah Center 
Tower 3, 4th Floor, Office 406 
Riyadh 12633-7437 
Saudi Arabia 

  Phone +966 11 411 5500 
Mobile +966 55 218 3099 
Email 218@awtad.sa 
www.awtad.sa 
  

  
  
  


